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Item 5.02 Departure of Directors or Certain Officers; Election of Directors; Appointment of Certain Officers; Compensatory Arrangements of
Certain Officers.

On December 28, 2022, the Compensation Committee of the Board of Directors (the “Compensation Committee”) of Sonder Holdings, Inc. (the
“Company”) amended (i) the performance-based vesting stock option to purchase 4,728,634 shares of the Company’s common stock (the “Performance
Stock Option”) held by Francis Davidson, the Company’s Chief Executive Officer (the “CEO”) (such amendment, the “Option Amendment”) and (ii) the
1,498,850 unvested shares of common stock subject to performance-based vesting (the “Performance Restricted Stock”) held by the CEO (such
amendment, the “Restricted Stock Amendment,” and together with the Option Amendment, the “Equity Award Amendments”).

The Compensation Committee approved the Equity Award Amendments based on the recommendations of the Compensation Committee’s independent
compensation consultant in order to align the CEO’s near-term goals with those of the Company’s stockholders in connection with the challenging
economic environment and to maximize the retention value of the Performance Stock Option and the Performance Restricted Stock to the Company. The
Compensation Committee believes that the Equity Award Amendments will help to retain and incentivize the CEO as the Company continues to grow.

Performance Stock Option

The Performance Stock Option was granted to the CEO in February 2021 by Sonder Operating Inc., formerly known as Sonder Holdings Inc. (“Legacy
Sonder”), pursuant to the terms and conditions of the Legacy Sonder 2019 Equity Incentive Plan, as amended (the “2019 Plan”) and an option agreement
between the CEO and Legacy Sonder (the “Performance Stock Option Agreement”). On January 18, 2022, in connection with the business combination
between the Company and Legacy Sonder (the “Business Combination”), the Performance Stock Option was assumed by the Company and converted into
an option to purchase shares of the Company’s common stock at an adjusted exercise price, but otherwise remained subject to the same terms and
conditions as set forth in the 2019 Plan and the Performance Stock Option Agreement. On December 1, 2022, the Performance Stock Option was amended
pursuant to the Company’s Offer to Reprice Eligible Stock Options to reduce its exercise price from $6.09 to $1.74 per share and to provide that no shares
subject to the Performance Stock Option will be eligible to vest until December 1, 2023, subject to the CEO’s continued service through such date, but
otherwise remained subject to the same terms and conditions as set forth in the 2019 Plan and the Performance Stock Option Agreement.

The Performance Stock Option Agreement provides that, subject to the CEO remaining an employee through the applicable measurement date, the shares
subject to the Performance Stock Option will vest in three equal tranches if the Company achieves certain stock price targets reflecting market
capitalization goals prior to December 31, 2025, December 31, 2026, and December 31, 2027, respectively (each, a “Market Value Target”). The
Company’s stock price, for purposes of measuring attainment of a Market Value Target, is the simple average of the closing price of a share of the
Company’s common stock for any 30 consecutive calendar day period, provided that if the Company experiences a change in control, the Company’s stock
price, for purposes of measuring attainment of the Market Value Targets, will be equal to the fair market value of the consideration per share of the
Company’s common stock received by the stockholders of the Company in such change in control, valued as of the date of the change in control. If a
Market Value Target is not achieved by the applicable deadline date, the shares subject to such target will be forfeited at no cost to the Company. The
Market Value Targets may be equitably adjusted for any capitalization adjustments pursuant to the 2019 Plan.

Prior to the Option Amendment, the Market Value Targets required to be achieved by December 31, 2023, December 31, 2024 and December 31, 2025
were approximately $15.20, $21.10, and $24.05. Pursuant to the Option Amendment, the Compensation Committee adjusted the dates for the Market Value
Targets to be achieved, and the Market Value Targets required to be achieved, to December 31, 2025, December 31, 2026 and December 31, 2027, and to
$4.53, $6.39 and $7.14, respectively.

Performance Restricted Stock

The CEO purchased the Performance Restricted Stock on December 2, 2019 pursuant to the “early exercise” of an option to purchase shares of Legacy
Sonder granted to the CEO on November 15, 2019 pursuant to the terms and conditions of the Legacy Sonder Stock Option Plan, as amended (the “Legacy
Sonder Plan”) and an equity award agreement between the CEO and Legacy Sonder (the “Performance Grant Agreement”).

The shares subject to the Performance Grant Agreement were divided into four separate vesting tranches: (i) a tranche subject to time-based vesting, (ii) a
tranche subject to Legacy Sonder becoming publicly traded (the “IPO Shares”), (iii) a tranche subject to Legacy Sonder achieving certain capital-raising
transactions (the “Financing Shares”), and (iv) a tranche subject to



Legacy Sonder achieving a market valuation of $5 billion prior to November 19, 2026, consisting of the Performance Restricted Stock. On February 18,
2021, the Performance Grant Agreement was amended to fully accelerate the vesting of the IPO Shares and the Financing Shares, and to clarify that the
Performance Restricted Stock shall be eligible to vest in connection with a special purpose acquisition company transaction and that otherwise achieves the
performance goals applicable to the Performance Restricted Stock using an equivalent share price rather than market. On January 18, 2022, in connection
with the Business Combination, the Performance Restricted Stock was assumed by the Company and converted into unvested shares of the Company’s
common stock, but otherwise remained subject to the same terms and conditions as set forth in the Legacy Sonder Plan and the Performance Grant
Agreement.

Prior to the Restricted Stock Amendment, the estimated price per share of the Company’s common stock that would be required to meet the market
capitalization goal of $5 billion by November 19, 2026 was approximately $18.05. Pursuant to the Restricted Stock Amendment, the Compensation
Committee adjusted the performance goal required to be achieved by November 19, 2026 from a market capitalization goal of $5 billion to a stock price
target of $5.27. The Company’s stock price, for purposes of measuring attainment of the Performance Restricted Stock target of $5.27 per share, is the
simple average of the closing price of a share of the Company’s common stock for any 30 consecutive calendar day period, provided that if the Company
experiences a change in control, the Company’s stock price, for purposes of measuring attainment of the Performance Restricted Stock target of $5.27 per
share, will be equal to the fair market value of the consideration per share of the Company’s common stock received by the stockholders of the Company in
such change in control, valued as of the date of the change in control. If the target is not achieved by November 19, 2026, the Performance Restricted Stock
will fail to vest. The target may be equitably adjusted for any capitalization adjustments pursuant to the Legacy Sonder Plan.

As a result of the Equity Award Amendments, the Company expects to recognize a non-cash charge for stock-based compensation expense over the
requisite service period.
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